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August 24, 2020

Mission School Transportation
James Lasky

6500 Hollister Ave.

Goleta, CA 93117

Re: Field/Athletic Trip Transportation Services Bid # 112-19

Dear Mr. Lasky,

Per the terms and conditions of Contract #112-19 for Field/Athletic Trip Transportation Services,
this contract may be renewed by mutual consent for an additional one (1) year. This would be
year two (2) of a five-year contract. The District has received your request to renew dated
August 14, 2020 and will accept your proposed rate increase of 1.9%.

In order to renew Contract #112-19 for the period August 30, 2020 through August 30, 2021,
please sign and return this acknowledgement to this office U.S. Mail. Also, please email a copy
of this signed renewal letter within five (5) working days. Email to jgeiszler@nmusd.us.

Sincerely,

Jon Geiszler
Director — Purchasing & Warehouse

ACCEPTED: Renewal of Contract #112-19
August 30, 2020 through August 30, 2021
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BID FORM

Name of Bidder: Mission School Transportation, Inc.
To: Newport-Mesa Unified School District acting by and through its Governing Board, herein
called the "District."

1. The undersigned Bidder, having become familiarized with all the following
documents including but not limited to the Notice Calling for Bids, Bid Objective, Information for
Bidders, Bid Form including Price Sheet, Information Required of Bidder, Designation of
Subcontractors Form, Noncollusion Declaration, Workers’ Compensation Certificate, Agreement,
Drug-Free Workplace Certification, Criminal Records Check Certification, Tobacco Use Policy
Certification, all insurance requirements, General Conditions and Special Conditions, and all
modifications, addenda and amendments, if any (hereinafter Bid Documents), the local conditions
affecting the performance of the services and the cost of the services at the place where the services
are to be performed, hereby proposes and agrees to be bound by all the terms and conditions of the
Bid Documents and agrees to perform, within the time stipulated, the services, including all of its
component parts, and everything required to be performed, and to provide and furnish and pay for
any and all of the labor, materials, tools, expendable equipment, and all applicable taxes, necessary
to perform the services and complete in a good workmanlike manner all of the services required in
accordance with laws, codes, regulations, ordinances and any other legal requirements governing the
services, in connection with the following:

Field/Athletic Trip Transportation Services
Bid No. 112-19

all in strict conformity with the Bid Documents, including Addenda No(s). __ _, , on file at
the Purchasing Office of the Newport-Mesa Unified School District for the sums set forth in the

Bid Form Price Sheet.

Bid Form Price Sheet Pricing for the period 8/31/20 - 8/30/21

S.P.A.B. SCHOOL BUS PLEASE BID AT A PER HOUR RATE

Item #1 — 44-48 Passenger Bus

1.A. | Base rate, 4-hour minimum
$ 473.84 for 4 hours

Hourly rate, live hours after 4 hours

$ 81.52
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Pricing for the period 8/31/20 - 8/30/21

1-B. | Base rate, drop/return Orange County / Round trip
$ No Bid

Hourly rate, live hours after 2 hours

$ NoBid

Item #2- 50 or More Passenger Bus 2.A. | Base rate, 4-hour minimum

$ 478.93 for 4 hours

Hourly rate, live hours after 4 hours

$ 81.52

2.B. | Base rate, drop/return Orange County / Round trip

$ No Bid

Item #3 - 43 Passenger Wheelchair 3-A. | Base rate, 4-hour minimum
Accessible Bus

$ 478.93 for 4 hours

Hourly rate, live hours after 4 hours
$ 81.52

3-B. | Base rate, drop/return Orange County / Round trip

$ No Bid

Item #4 - Mountain Trips — Flat Rates,

One Way

44-48 Passenger Bus Lower §  831.44
Middle $  881.44
Upper §  881.44
Idyllwild $ 881.44

50+ Passenger Bus Lower$  891.63

Middle §  891.63

Upper$§  891.63

Idyllwild § 891.63
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Pricing for the period 8/31/20 - 8/30/21

43 Passenger Wheelchair Accessible Bus Lower §  891.63
Middle $  891.63
Upper $  891.63

Idyllwild § 891.63

Item #5 - Out-of-State Trips

Daily Flat Rate § No Bid

Item #6 - California Multi-Day Trips

Daily Flat Rate § No Bid

Hourly Rate, per hour § No Bid

Fuel Surcharge:

S.P.A.B. RECLINER COACHES

PLEASE BID AT A PER HOUR RATE

Item #1 — 46-50 Passenger Bus 1-A. | Base rate, 4-hour minimum
$ NoBid
Hourly rate, live hours after 4 hours
$ NoBid
1-B. | Base rate, drop/return Orange County / Round trip
$ NoBid
Item #2 - 50 or More Passenger Bus 2-A. | Base rate, 4-hour minimum
$ No Bid
Hourly rate, live hours after 4 hours
$ NoBid
2-B. | Base rate, drop/return Orange County / Round trip
$ No Bid
Hourly rate, live hours after 2 hours
$ No Bid
Item #3 - 43 Passenger Wheelchair 3-A. | Base rate, 4-hour minimum

Accessible Bus

$ No Bid
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Pricing for the period 8/31/20 - 8/30/21

Hourly rate, live hours after 4 hours

$ No Bid
3-B. | Base rate, drop/return Orange County / Round trip
$ NoBid
Item #4 - Mountain Trips — Flat Rates,
One Way
46-50 Passenger Bus Lower §  NoBid
Middle $  No Bid
Upper $  No Bid
Idyllwild § No Bid
50+ Passenger Bus Lower §  No Bid
Middle $  No Bid
Upper §  NoBid
Idyllwild $ No Bid
43 Passenger Wheelchair Accessible Bus Lower §  NoBid
Middle $ No Bid
Upper $  No Bid
Idyllwild $ No Bid
Item #5 - Out-of-State Trips Daily Flat Rate $ No Bid
No Bid

Item #6 - California Multi-Day Trips

Daily Flat Rate $

Hourly Rate, per hour $§ No Bid

Fuel Surcharge:

None

No waiting time charge, no cancellation of trip charge. Costs shall be all inclusive, including
operating expenses, maintenance, taxes, worker’s compensation costs, union benefits, if
applicable, employee health and welfare benefits and wages, supervisory and management

expenses, fuel, overhead and profit.

Specific camp schedules are subject to change, and student counts may vary.

Schools attending the same camp on the same date may be combined.
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